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Interpreting the 1954 U.S. Intervention in Guatemala: 
Realist, Revisionist, and Postrevisionist Perspectives 

Stephen M. Streeter 
McMaster University, Hamilton, Ontario 

AT NINE IN THE EVENING of June 27, 1954, Guatemalan President 
Jacobo Arbenz Guzmain announced his resignation. The beleaguered 
colonel had many reasons for abandoning the presidency. His 1952 land 
reform program, known as Decree 900, had enraged wealthy planters and 
United Fruit Company (UFCO) officials, who spread propaganda tagging 
Arbenz as a Communist. Earlier in 1954, at the Tenth Inter-American 
Conference in Caracas, Venezuela, the Eisenhower administration had 
isolated Guatemala by bludgeoning members of the Organization of 
American States (OAS) into adopting an anticommunist resolution which 
insinuated that the Arbenz regime had become a Communist beachhead. 
Then, on June 17, Colonel Carlos Castillo Armas and his band of several 
hundred peasant soldiers-the so-called Liberation Army-had invaded 
Guatemala from Honduras with logistical support from a covert U.S. 
Central Intelligence Agency (CIA) operation code-named PBSUCCESS. 
As the Liberation army stumbled its way through the countryside, un- 
marked planes strafed Guatemala City while radio broadcasters jammed 
the airwaves with rumors that the government was collapsing. Although 
the early stages of the invasion had gone poorly for Castillo Armas, the 
Guatemalan army decided on the 25th to abandon the battlefield in 
Zacapa. The high command refused the president's order to arm the 
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62 Stephen M. Streeter 

civilian militias, and instead demanded that he step down. Feeling ex- 
hausted, confused, and cornered, Arbenz surrendered the government to 
the army, hoping desperately that the invaders might still be repelled. But 
U.S. officials threatened, cajoled, and bribed Castillo Armas's military 
rivals, so that by July 1st the "Liberation" had triumphed. 

The chain of events that led to Arbenz' s downfall has intrigued histori- 
ans for decades. How important was PBSUCCESS to Castillo Armas's 
victory? Did President Eisenhower know about the operation? If so, why 
did he order Arbenz's removal? What role did the UFCO play in the 
intervention? Many Eisenhower administration officials, including the 
Secretary of State, John Foster Dulles and his brother Allen who headed 
the CIA, owned stock in the company, so did the Liberation really 
represent a conspiracy between United States public and private eco- 
nomic interests? And what about Arbenz? Was he a Communist? How 
influential was the Communist Party in Guatemala and was it tied to the 
Soviets? In short, was there really a communist threat in Central America 
that the Eisenhower administration prudently removed? Or did anticom- 
munism serve merely as the pretext for overthrowing a nationalist regime 
that threatened U.S. hegemony? 

Historians' answers to these questions have both shaped and reflected 
the debate among realists, revisionists, and postrevisionists over the 
wellsprings and consequences of U.S. foreign policy during the Cold 
War. Realists, who concern themselves primarily with power politics, 
have generally blamed the Cold War on an aggressive, expansionist 
Soviet empire. Because realists believe that Arbenz was a Soviet puppet, 
they view his overthrow as the necessary rollback of communism in the 
Western Hemisphere. Revisionists, who place the majority of the blame 
for the Cold War on the United States, emphasize how Washington 
sought to expand overseas markets and promote foreign investment, 
especially in the Third World. Revisionists allege that because the State 
Department came to the rescue of the UFCO, the U.S. intervention in 
Guatemala represents a prime example of economic imperialism. 
Postrevisionists, a difficult group to define precisely, incorporate both 
strategic and economic factors in their interpretation of the Cold War. 
They tend to agree with revisionists on the issue of Soviet responsibility, 
but they are much more concerned with explaining the cultural and 
ideological influences that warped Washington's perception of the Com- 
munist threat. According to postrevisionists, the Eisenhower administra- 
tion officials turned against Arbenz because they failed to grasp that he 
represented a nationalist rather than a communist.' 

The root of the realist interpretation can be traced to propaganda 
spread by the architects of PBSUCCESS. After the covert operation 
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concluded, the Eisenhower administration as well as Castillo Armas and 
his followers asserted that the Liberation represented a popular revolu- 
tion against a Communist dictatorship. Assistant Secretary of State for 
Inter-American Affairs Henry F. Holland, for example, declared that "the 
people of Guatemala rose and dispersed the little group of traitors who 
had tried to subvert their government into another communist satellite."2 
The State Department also denied that its opposition to Arbenz could be 
traced to the Fruit Company's financial woes. Several weeks before the 
invasion began, Secretary of State John Foster Dulles announced: "If the 
United Fruit matter were settled, if they gave a gold piece for every 
banana, the problem would remain as it is today as far as the presence of 
Communist infiltration in Guatemala is concerned."3 

Arbenz and his supporters, by contrast, denigrated the Liberation as an 
international conspiracy masterminded by U.S.-based multinational cor- 
porations. "Our crime," Arbenz explained in his resignation speech, "is 
having enacted an agrarian reform which affected the interests of the 
United Fruit Company."4 A 1955 study by the Partido Guatemalteco del 
Trabajo (PGT, Guatemalan Communist Party) identified the UFCO and 
various Rockefeller interests as the major culprits in the plot against 
Arbenz. Guatemalan exiles portrayed Castillo Armas as a Wall Street 
lackey, who received Washington's backing because he promised to 
return land to the UFCO.5 These conflicting versions of the Liberation 
played out separately in the United States and Latin America. To cover- 
up PBSUCCESS, the State Department derailed an OAS investigation 
and issued several white papers on Guatemala that branded Arbenz as a 
Communist. U.S. journalists and reporters churned out sensational narra- 
tives in which Castillo Armas, the heroic "Liberator," saved the Guate- 
malan people from the ferocious tyranny of the communist dictator, 
"Red" Jacobo. This disinformation campaign succeeded admirably in the 
United States, but it flopped badly in Latin America. Demonstrations led 
by students, labor organizations, and nationalists castigated the Eisenhower 
administration for coming to the defense of United Fruit.6 The State 
Department's troubleshooter for Latin America, Adolf A. Berle, told his 
diary: "We eliminated a Communist regime-at the expense of having 
antagonized half the hemisphere."7 Kalman Silvert, a North American 
academic who specialized in Latin American studies, reported in 1956 
that a famous Mexican bookstore had sold thousands of books by Arbenz's 
supporters, but only five copies of the most prominent Liberacionista 
tract.8 

In the 1950s, anticommunist scholars such as Daniel James, Ronald 
Schneider, and John Martz asserted that the Eisenhower administration 
had accurately gaged the Communist threat in Guatemala. According to 
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these realists, Washington and the rest of the hemisphere turned against 
Arbenz after U.S. intelligence revealed a secret shipment of Czech arms 
bound for Guatemala aboard the Swedish freighter Alfhem.9 Political 
tracts by Castillo Armas's supporters also glorified the Liberation as a 
heroic defeat of communism, but they made little or no mention of 
outside assistance.'0 Even as hard evidence of PBSUCCESS began to 
leak out, U.S. officials continued to insist that the Arbenz regime posed a 
grave security threat to the United States. CIA agent David Atlee Phillips, 
for example, later reflected that documents left behind by Arbenz had 
"revealed a paradigm of Soviet Cold War expansionism, a program 
clearly intended to establish a power base in the Western Hemisphere."" 

Revisionists, by contrast, defended Arbenz as a nationalist, not a 
communist, and they blamed his downfall on Yankee imperialism. The 
financial ties between U.S. government officials and the company, the 
massacre of at least 1,000 banana workers on a UFCO plantation imme- 
diately following the Liberation, and Castillo Armas's decision to return 
land confiscated from United Fruit under Decree 900, all seemed to point 
toward a conspiracy.12 Miguel Ydigoras Fuentes, who served as president 
from 1958 to 1963, published memoirs charging that in 1954 several CIA 
agents had tried to recruit him to lead the Liberation on behalf of U.S. 
corporations with investments in Guatemala.'3 Two Fruit Company pub- 
lic relations agents, Thomas Corcoran and Edward L. Bernays, bragged 
openly that they had promoted news stories about the Communist threat 
in Guatemala in order to convince the U.S. government to remove 
Arbenz.14 

For several reasons the revisionist interpretation of the Liberation 
gradually gained favor among U.S. academics during the 1960s and 
1970s. The rise of the New Left and the legacy of the Vietnam War 
caused some historians to question many of the prevailing dogmas of the 
Cold War. Revisionist historians such as William Appleman Williams, 
Richard J. Barnet, and Joyce and Gabriel Kolko, for example, argued that 
the United States generally opposed democracy in the Third World. In 
their view, the Open Door policy had led to countless U.S. interventions 
in underdeveloped regions such as Latin America in order to protect 
trade, markets, and North American businesses such as the UFCO.'5 

The rise in the popularity of dependency theory in the 1970s also 
encouraged Latin American scholars to view episodes such as the U.S. 
intervention in Guatemala as an example of how economic interests of 
the core, or First World, dominated the periphery, or Third World.16 As 
one dependista explained, "the UFCO propaganda campaign in combina- 
tion with such factors as the prevalent ideological climate in the United 
States and the close linkages with governmental decision makers, among 
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others, led to a positive assertion of core interests that for all practical 
purposes constituted a defense of UFCO interests in Guatemala."'7 The 
North American Congress on Latin America, a leftist think tank which 
served as the leading proponent of the dependency school in the United 
States, proposed that an "intervention lobby" had managed to prod the 
Eisenhower administration into deposing Arbenz. The lobby, according 
to the political scientist Suzanne Jonas, formed "part of a broad network 
of power on Wall Street and in Washington that included or had ties with 
nearly all interest groups involved in foreign policy formation. On its 
own board, and through its law firms, banks, etc., UFCO integrated the 
principal Eastern groups-the Rockefellers, Standard Oil interests, the 
Morgans, and the Boston bluebloods-which dominated the foreign policy 
apparatus." At the center of this "intervention nexus" stood the law firm 
of Sullivan and Cromwell, a highly influential lobbyist for United Fruit. 
John Foster Dulles, who had been a senior partner for Sullivan and 
Cromwell in the 1930s, had helped broker the deal that enabled the 
UFCO to control Guatemala's only railway.'8 

The popularity of the revisionist interpretation peaked in the early 
1980s with the appearance of Bitter Fruit, a cloak-and-dagger thriller that 
described in lurid detail how Fruit Company officials had conspired with 
the Eisenhower administration to topple Arbenz. The two journalists who 
authored the study, Stephen Schlesinger and Stephen Kinzer, insisted that 
the UFCO had played a "decisive" role in the coup because, had the 
company not redbaited Arbenz and exaggerated the Communist threat, 
the Eisenhower administration probably would have ignored Guatemala. 
Numerous ties between company and government officials, Schlesinger 
and Kinzer asserted, gave the UFCO extraordinary influence in Washing- 
ton. Before launching PBSUCCESS, CIA Director Allen Dulles alleg- 
edly promised a top UFCO official that any government which succeeded 
Arbenz would protect the company's interests.19 Bitter Fruit received 
great accolades in the mainstream press. One awed reviewer exclaimed, 
"It's a fantastic yamrn-yet it all actually happened."20 In truth, Schlesinger 
and Kinzer's study relied on selective and circumstantial evidence, some 
of it highly disputable.21 Richard Bissell, the CIA official who directed 
PBSUCCESS, later recalled, "I never heard Allen Dulles discuss United 
Fruit's interests."22 Adolf A. Berle told Costa Rican leader Jos6 Figueres: 
"Of course, we expected American rights to be protected, including the 
United Fruit Company; but the United Fruit Company's interests were 
secondary to the main interests."23 

The first archival-based account of PBSUCCESS, which appeared at 
roughly the same time as Bitter Fruit, challenged the conspiracy thesis of 
Schlesinger and Kinzer. The CIA in Guatemala, by Richard H. Immerman, 
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defended the revisionist view that the Arbenz regime did not constitute a 
Soviet threat to the United States. The study also revealed that the CIA's 
logistical assistance proved crucial to Castillo Armas's victory. Accord- 
ing to Immerman, however, the Eisenhower administration decided to 
remove Arbenz, not because of lobbying pressure from United Fruit, but 
because U.S. officials had confused communism and nationalism. The 
State Department had failed to grasp that Arbenz was a "middle-class 
reformer" who had enacted a land reform to prevent, not encourage, the 
spread of communism.24 

By emphasizing how misunderstandings had led to the overthrow of 
Arbenz, Immerman's study encouraged investigations into how psychol- 
ogy, bureaucratic politics, and cultural bias shaped Washington's con- 
ception of the Communist threat in Guatemala and elsewhere. Eisenhower 
postrevisionists, for example, have argued that the president and his 
advisors routinely confused anticolonialism and nationalism with com- 
munism in the Third World.25 Cole Blasier, a former State Department 
official who has analyzed U.S. responses to revolutions in Latin America, 
has emphasized how exaggerated fears of communism distorted U.S. 
policymaker's judgments during the Cold War.26 Diplomatic discourses 
also provide clues to the intervention in Guatemala. The tendency to 
divide the world into "good" and "evil," or "prophetic dualism," as one 
study has put it, enabled the Eisenhower administration to stifle public 
debate over Guatemala.27 Another scholar has contended that Washington's 
"dependent image" of Guatemala helped U.S. officials create a stereo- 
type of Arbenz that could not be challenged by conflicting evidence.28 
The CIA's success in toppling the nationalist regime in Iran in 1953 also 
influenced Eisenhower's approach to Guatemala. "Quick fix crisis man- 
agement" and false analogies help explain why covert action became the 
weapon of choice against Arbenz.29 

The combination of archival research and critical theory enabled 
postrevisionists to correct and refine the interpretation of revisionist 
studies, many of which suffered from excessive counterfactual reasoning 
and economic determinism. But the postrevisionist school also had its 
weaknesses. The social critic Noam Chomsky complained that Richard 
Immerman's account failed to explain the root cause of the U.S. interven- 
tion in Guatemala. Most imperial minded leaders, Chomsky observed, 
"come to believe the propaganda they produce in an effort to justify 
brutal and murderous acts undertaken in the interests of dominant domes- 
tic forces."30 Likewise, the historian Ronald Pruessen found Immerman's 
description of anticommunism excessively broad. What combination of 
"political, strategic, economic, psychological and/or ideological factors," 
Pruessen wondered, led Washington to remove Arbenz.31 
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But perhaps the biggest mistake the postrevisionists made was to 
ignore the role of the Guatemalans themselves. By focusing exclusively 
on the U.S. documentary record, many scholars fell into the trap of 
reproducing "the world according to Washington."32 In 1991 Piero 
Gleijeses published a path-breaking account of the Guatemalan episode 
that overcame many of these weaknesses. Shattered Hope uncovered 
many new sources and clarified three major interpretive issues. First, 
Gleijeses presented a much clearer picture of the Communist threat in 
Guatemala. Interviews with Arbenz's widow and high-ranking members 
of the Guatemalan Communist Party revealed that although Arbenz 
himself never joined the Communists officially he became highly influ- 
enced by their ideas. It was precisely because Arbenz sympathized with 
the Communist vision that he enacted the land reform. According to the 
crude Marxist theory endorsed by the party, Guatemala was still in its 
feudal stage and had to pass through capitalism before it could make the 
transition to socialism. At the same time, Gleijeses also emphasizes that 
Moscow clearly did not control the Guatemalan communists. To the 
contrary, although Guatemalan Communist party members desperately 
sought Soviet advice and aid, Moscow wasn't interested. 

Second, Shattered Hope verified the claim of postrevisionist studies 
that Eisenhower administration officials had viewed the Fruit company's 
plight as a "subsidiary" problem, secondary to the issue of communism. 
In the 1940s the United Fruit Company had been able to influence 
Washington because U.S. diplomats knew almost nothing about the 
region. According to Gleijeses, U.S. reporting on Guatemala during the 
Truman administration reflected arrogance, ethnocentrism, and immense 
ignorance. As the embassy became more sophisticated in its understand- 
ing of Guatemala, however, the company's influence dwindled. Jose 
Manuel Fortuny, the former leader of the Guatemalan Communist party, 
summed up well the insignificance of United Fruit to the U.S. interven- 
tion in Guatemala: "They would have overthrown us even if we had 
grown no bananas."33 

Third, Eisenhower administration officials worried less about the im- 
pact of Arbenz's land reform on United Fruit than they did about its 
impact on the countryside. One intelligence estimate warned that the 
agrarian reform would "mobilize the hitherto inert peasantry in support 
of the Administration" and "afford the Communists an opportunity to 
extend their influence by organizing the peasants as they have organized 
other workers."34 Gleijeses's interviews reveal that U.S. intelligence had 
accurately depicted the Communists' intentions. According to Fortuny, 
the party believed that by administering Decree 900 through local com- 
mittees, it would be laying "the groundwork for the eventual radicalization 
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of the peasantry." The PGT elicited the support of Arbenz, who agreed to 
help "foster the control of the reform from below," and sow "the seeds of 
a more collective society.""3 U.S. officials understood that Guatemala's 
nationalist revolution was far more likely to spread by example than by 
force. One State Department official warned in late 1953 that Guatemala 
threatened the stability of Honduras and El Salvador because "its agrar- 
ian reform is a powerful propaganda weapon; [and] its broad social 
program of aiding the workers and peasants in a victorious struggle 
against the upper classes and large foreign enterprises has a strong appeal 
to the populations of Central American neighbors where similar condi- 
tions prevail."36 

Although Shattered Hope appeared to be the last word on the U.S. 
intervention in Guatemala, new documentation recently released by the 
CIA has helped clarify some of the mysteries surrounding its role in 
overthrowing Arbenz. In 1992 the agency hired the historian Nicholas 
Cullather to write the official account of PBSUCCESS. The CIA's chief 
historian, Gerald Haines, also wrote a separate report on the agency's 
proposed assassination plots against the Arbenz regime. Both studies 
remained classified until 1997, when the CIA decided to release them as 
part of its so-called new openness policy. 

Perhaps the most startling revelation in these new studies is confirma- 
tion of earlier reports that the CIA had contemplated assassinating high- 
ranking officials in the Arbenz administration.37 The CIA originally 
devised assassination plots as part of PBFORTUNE, the first covert 
action plan to depose Arbenz. When that operation aborted in 1953, CIA 
officers drew up hit lists and offered training for Castillo Armas's "K" 
groups, which had been formed to eliminate prominent Guatemalan 
leaders during PBSUCCESS. Certain State Department officials consid- 
ered these proposals for a brief period in April 1954, but they eventually 
ruled them out as "counterproductive." Unfortunately, censors have re- 
moved the names of most officials from Haines's report, so we don't 
know how high up the plan went or even if the hit list included Arbenz.38 

Cullather's report, which has since been published by Stanford Uni- 
versity Press, offers a close look at PBSUCCESS through the eyes of the 
intelligence community. Like the postrevisionists, Cullather downplays 
the role of United Fruit and highlights security concerns. Indeed, it was 
the CIA rather than the UFCO that persuaded the State Department to pay 
attention to Guatemala. Agency analysts feared, not that the PGT was 
going to seize power immediately, but that the land reform offered the 
Communists an unprecedented opportunity to organize the masses.39 

The CIA study also offers new evidence regarding two important 
historical issues. First, why did the agency choose Carlos Castillo Armas 
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instead of Miguel Ydigoras Fuentes or Juan C6rdova Cerna to lead the 
Liberation? According to Cullather, PBSUCCESS officers passed over 
Ydigoras because they considered the general to be too "ambitious, 
opportunistic, and unscrupulous." They also scratched C6rdova Cerna 
from the list because he served as legal counsel to United Fruit, which 
might have given credence to charges of banana imperialism. Castillo 
Armas, in contrast to the other candidates, appeared more innocent, 
likeable, and pliable. Aside from anticommunism he had no clear politi- 
cal philosophy, and therefore could be told what to do. The colonel also 
did not look like the traditional caudillo or strongman. "This is no Latin 
American dictator with a whip," commented one agency informant.40 

The second issue concerns the importance of PBSUCCESS to Castillo 
Armas' s victory. In 1990 the historian Frederick Marks tried to revive the 
"realist" interpretation that the Liberation represented a popular revolu- 
tion against communism. According to Marks, historians have exagger- 
ated the CIA's role in securing Castillo Armas's victory just as they have 
underestimated the military achievements of the Liberation army.41 How- 
ever, Cullather's study verifies the criticisms of Stephen Rabe, who 
found major flaws in Marks's research, including an excessive reliance 
on accounts by Castillo Armas's supporters and a failure to consider 
contradictory evidence.42 Castillo Armas's soldiers did not have rockets 
or artillery, as Marks claimed, nor did they outfight the Guatemalan 
army. Castillo Armas did gain some followers as the invasion proceeded, 
but only in towns where the soldiers met no resistance. These new 
recruits may actually have been more of a hindrance than an asset 
because as they had to be fed and equipped.43 

Some analysts have judged the CIA's air support for Castillo Armas as 
the crucial component of PBSUCCESS that defeated Arbenz. To demon- 
strate the importance of air power, numerous studies cite Allen Dulles's 
comment to President Eisenhower on June 23 that the chances of victory 
stood at only twenty percent unless he ordered more planes. Richard 
Bissell considered air support as the most "decisive" factor in Arbenz's 
downfall.44 Cullather observes, however, that the aircraft did not improve 
the military situation in the field. He discounts as an "agency legend" the 
explanation that Arbenz resigned because he had lost his nerve in the face 
of the air attacks and radio propaganda.45 In truth, the CIA got lucky. 
There is evidence of incompetence, near misses, and operational fias- 
coes: the botched attempt to depose Arbenz in 1953 (PBFORTUNE); 
Castillo Armas's military incompetence; Arbenz's complacency (such as 
waiting too long to arm the popular militias); major breaches of security 
(Arbenz's spies penetrated PBSUCCESS); disinformation flops (the Gua- 
temalan press discounted as a fake the cache of Soviet arms planted by 
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the CIA); the dropping of bombs that turned out to be duds; near backfir- 
ing of bribery attempts; and staffing the psywar radio operation with 
untrained illiterate technicians. 

Considering all of this, Cullather joins many analysts in attributing the 
downfall of Arbenz to his army's lack of loyalty. Had the high command 
chosen to fight seriously they could have easily crushed Castillo Armas's 
ragtag band. Most military officers chose to abandon Arbenz, however, 
because they had grown weary of the ethnic conflict triggered by the land 
reform and because they feared that thwarting PBSUCCESS would only 
invite a much larger U.S. military intervention. The transition between 
Arbenz and Castillo Armas represented, in reality, a military coup, not a 
mass-based revolution against communism.46 

One might be tempted to conclude from this lengthy review of the U.S. 
intervention in Guatemala that the topic has been exhausted. But histori- 
ography also teaches that our interpretation of momentous events can 
change slightly or dramatically as new evidence becomes available or as 
the popularity of certain historical theories rise and fall. There are still 
major gaps in the historical record that would be worth filling. Certain 
portions of the U.S. documentary record remain classified or sanitized, 
and the United Fruit Company has yet to open its archives. Still, it might 
be useful to take stock of the debate, because certain interpretations can 
be laid to rest. The Soviet Union did not control Guatemala in 1954, nor 
were local Communists on the verge of seizing power. The Liberation 
never would have succeeded without PBSUCCESS, which is not to say 
that Arbenz would have remained in power indefinitely. The historian 
Jim Handy, for example, has shown that many military officers had 
become disturbed over Arbenz's land reform for both personal and 
ideological reasons. Plotting against Arbenz had begun in early 1954, and 
it seems likely that Arbenz would have fallen regardless of the U.S. 
intervention.47 The original revisionist claim that United Fruit master- 
minded Arbenz's defeat also appears untenable. Company's records, if 
they ever become available, are unlikely to provide the smoking gun. If 
the UFCO was so important, then why is there so little evidence of its 
influence in the U.S. declassified record? It is possible, of course, that key 
documents are still being withheld from researchers, but there is no 
longer any reason to protect the company. Immediately after PB SUCCESS 
concluded, the Eisenhower administration permitted the Justice Depart- 
ment to proceed with a long delayed antitrust suit against United Fruit 
that weakened its monopoly and contributed to the company's eventual 
disintegration. 

If there is any controversy left, it will probably continue to revolve 
around the reasons for the Eisenhower administration's decision to topple 
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Arbenz. For some scholars, it may seem pointless to try and rank the 
causes of the intervention. "To emphasize either strategic or economic 
motives in analyzing U.S. policies toward Guatemala," the historian 
Stephen G. Rabe has written, "is perhaps to draw distinctions without 
differences."48 But for others, the Eisenhower administration's motiva- 
tion for intervening in Guatemala bears directly on the issue of American 
responsibility for the violence that engulfed the country after Arbenz's 
departure. Between 1954 and 1994 Guatemala experienced a gruesome 
civil war that left more than 150,000 dead.49 The scholar Robert Pastor 
exculpates Washington for this tragedy; the policymakers who engi- 
neered PBSUCCESS were honest, sincere, and well-intentioned men, 
even if they were wrong to regard Arbenz as a Communist. To Piero 
Gleijeses, however, the Eisenhower administration's pursued its hege- 
monic objectives in Guatemala without regard for the fate of the Guate- 
malan people. U.S. officials stand guilty, in his words, of "wanton 
criminal negligence."50 

Like the longstanding controversy over the origins of the Cold War, 
the debate over the U.S. intervention in Guatemala is not likely to be 
resolved solely by the discovery of new documents. What is known now 
about PBSUCCESS is so vastly superior to the evidence available forty 
years ago that historians can concentrate more on interpreting the evi- 
dence than on uncovering more of it. Advancements in historical inter- 
pretation usually depend on the discovery of new sources and/or new 
theoretical approaches. In this case, the historical literature on the U.S. 
intervention in Guatemala has matured to the point where it is now 
possible to narrate fairly clearly the series of events that led to Arbenz's 
downfall. Much more contentious will be how to deconstruct this story 
now that the Cold War is over. 
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